2009 SPRING TIMBER SALES - FLORENCE COUNTY FOREST

* BORDER SHADED AREA INDICATES HIGHEST BIDDER

SALE #1 STOLEN GRANDMA SALE - 40 ACRES - TWO YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ MINERICK DELAET
MBF MINIMUM LOGGING ENTERPRISES LTD
0 BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
ASPEN PULP 650 Cds $ 27.00 $ 17,550.00 $ 27.00 $ 17,550.00 $ 2240 $ 14,560.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 240 Cds $ 2250 $ 5,400.00 $ 2200 $ 5,280.00 $ 30.40 $ 7,296.00
SPRUCE PULP 20 Cds $ 2250 $ 450.00 $ 35.00 $ 700.00 $ 3240 $ 648.00
FIR PULP 70 Cds $ 18.00 $ 1,260.00 $ 2200 $ 1,540.00 $ 18.40 $ 1,288.00
ASPEN BOLTS 280 Cds $ 36.00 $ 10,080.00 $ 40.00 $ 11,200.00 $ 40.40 $ 11,312.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 60 Cds $ 36.00 $ 2,160.00 $ 30.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 51.40 $ 3,084.00
SPRUCE BOLTS 20 Cds $ 36.00 $ 720.00 $ 35.00 $ 700.00 $ 3240 $ 648.00
SPRUCE LOGS 2 MBF $ 117.00 $ 234.00 $ 70.00 $ 140.00 $ 65.00 $ 130.00
TOTALS 1,340 CDS $ 37,854.00 $ 38,910.00 $ 38,966.00

No Bid Check



SALE #2 - LEGERSKI'S SALE -

52 ACRES - TWO YEAR CONTRACT - SCALE SALE

Cords/ MINERICK VERSO

MBF Minimum LOGGING PAPER INC

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
MIXED HDWD PULP 400 Cds $ 2250 $ 9,000.00 $ 28.00 $ 11,200.00 $ 25.07 $ 10,028.00
ASPEN PULP 230 Cds $ 27.00 $ 6,210.00 $ 28.00 $ 6,440.00 $ 23.07 $ 5,306.10
FIR/SPRUCE PULP 40 Cds $ 2250 $ 900.00 $ 25.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 20.00 $ 800.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 80 Cds $ 36.00 $ 2,880.00 $ 28.00 $ 2,240.00 $ 35.00 $ 2,800.00
ASPEN BOLTS 120 Cds $ 36.00 $ 4,320.00 $ 28.00 $ 3,360.00 $ 35.00 $ 4,200.00
FIR/SPRUCE BOLTS 10 Cds $ 36.00 $ 360.00 $ 25.00 $ 250.00 $ 35.00 $ 350.00
MIXED HDWD LOGS 1 MBF $ 180.00 $ 180.00 $ 125.00 $ 125.00 $ 200.00 $ 200.00
BASSWOOD LOGS 7 MBF $ 180.00 $ 1,260.00 $ 150.00 $ 1,050.00 $ 100.00 $ 700.00
HARD MAPLE LOGS 2 MBF $ 315.00 $ 630.00 $ 250.00 $ 500.00 $ 400.00 $ 800.00
TOTALS 880 CDS $  25,740.00 $ 26,165.00 $ 25,184.10

10 MBF No Bid Check Below Minimum



SALE # 3 - THAT SCRUB OAK SALE - 96 ACRES - THREE YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ VERSO TRIEST FOREST LEDVINA FOREST FRANK'S

MBF Minimum PAPER INC PRODUCTS PRODUCTS INC.

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
OAK PULP 1,240 Cds $ 18.00 $ 22,320.00 $ 2350 $ 29,140.00 $ 27.00 $ 33,480.00 $ 31.00 $ 38,440.00 $ 13.75 $ 17,050.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 270 Cds $ 2250 $ 6,075.00 $ 2711 $  7,319.70 $ 25.00 $ 6,750.00 $ 33.00 $ 8,910.00 $ 35.00 $ 9,450.00
ASPEN PULP 240 Cds $ 27.00 $ 6,480.00 $ 25.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 20.00 $ 4,800.00 $ 28.00 $ 6,720.00 $ 21.10 $ 5,064.00
OAK BOLTS 630 Cds $ 36.00 $ 22,680.00 $ 30.00 $ 18,900.00 $ 27.00 $ 17,010.00 $ 31.00 $ 19,530.00 $ 51.00 $ 32,130.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 70 Cds $ 36.00 $ 2,520.00 $ 30.00 $ 2,100.00 $ 27.00 $ 1,890.00 $ 33.00 $ 2,310.00 $ 55.00 $ 3,850.00
ASPEN BOLTS 80 Cds $ 36.00 $ 2,880.00 $ 30.00 $ 2,400.00 $ 27.00 $ 2,160.00 $ 28.00 $ 2,240.00 $ 50.00 $ 4,000.00

2,530 Cds $ 62,955.00 $ 65,859.70 $ 66,090.00 $ 78,150.00 $ 71,544.00
CONTINUED
SALE # 3 - THAT SCRUB OAK SALE - 96 ACRES - THREE YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ WILD RIVERS OLSON BROS. MINERICK DELAET

MBF Minimum FORESTRY INC. ENTERPRISES LLC LOGGING ENTERPRISES LTD

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
OAK PULP 1,240 Cds $ 18.00 $ 22,320.00 $ 28.80 $ 35,712.00 $ 2775 $ 34,410.00 $ 3762 $ 46,64880 $ 14.60 $ 18,104.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 270 Cds $ 22,50 $ 6,075.00 $ 3480 $ 9,396.00 $ 30.30 $ 8,181.00 $ 32.00 $ 8,640.00 $ 2060 $ 5,562.00
ASPEN PULP 240 Cds $ 27.00 $ 6,480.00 $ 2860 $ 6,864.00 $ 15.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 30.00 $ 7,200.00 $ 14.60 $  3,504.00
OAK BOLTS 630 Cds $ 36.00 $ 22,680.00 $ 50.15 $ 31,594.50 $ 27.75 $ 17,482.50 $ 3762 $ 23,70060 $ 26.60 $ 16,758.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 70 Cds $ 36.00 $ 2,520.00 $ 50.15 $ 3,510.50 $ 30.30 $ 2,121.00 $ 32.00 $ 2,240.00 $ 3260 $ 2,282.00
ASPEN BOLTS 80 Cds $ 36.00 $ 2,880.00 $ 55.10 $  4,408.00 $ 15.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 30.00 $ 2,400.00 $ 26.60 $ 2,128.00

2,530 Cds $  62,955.00 $ 91,485.00 $ 66,994.50 $ 90,829.40 $ 48,338.00

Error on A Bolt total
Below Minimum



SALE # 4 - BRETT FAVRE SALE - 98 ACRES - THREE YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ FRANK'S OLSON BROS. TRIEST FOREST RANDY MCKEE
MBF Minimum INC. ENTERPRISES LLC PRODUCTS TRUCKING INC.
Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
ASPEN PULP 1,290 Cds $ 27.00 $ 34,830.00 $ 30.10 $ 38,829.00 $ 20.10 $ 25,929.00 $ 30.00 $ 38,700.00 $ 32.00 $ 41,280.00
OAK PULP 560 Cds $ 18.00 $ 10,080.00 $ 15.10 $ 8,456.00 $ 28.50 $ 15,960.00 $ 27.00 $ 15,120.00 $ 30.00 $ 16,800.00
WHITE BIRCH PULP 345 Cds $ 2250 $ 7,762.50 $ 2450 $ 8,45250 $ 3275 $ 11,298.75 $ 25.00 $ 8,625.00 $ 30.00 $ 10,350.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 290 Cds $ 22,50 $ 6,525.00 $ 3450 $ 10,005.00 $ 3275 $ 9,497.50 $ 38.00 $ 11,020.00 $ 30.00 $ 8,700.00
ASPEN PULP BOLTS 1,050 Cds $ 36.00 $ 37,800.00 $ 64.64 $ 67,872.00 $ 20.10 $ 21,105.00 $ 33.00 $ 34,650.00 $ 40.80 $ 42,840.00
OAK BOLTS 125 Cds $ 36.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 51.00 $ 6,375.00 $ 28.50 $ 3,562.50 $ 33.00 $ 4,125.00 $ 30.00 $ 3,750.00
WHITE BIRCH BOLTS 100 Cds $ 36.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 51.50 $ 5,150.00 $ 3275 $ 3,275.00 $ 33.00 $ 3,300.00 $ 35.00 $ 3,500.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 50 Cds $ 36.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 5450 $ 2,725.00 $ 3275 $ 1,637.50 $ 33.00 $ 1,650.00 $ 30.00 $ 1,500.00
OAK LOGS 13 MBF $ 270.00 $ 3,510.00 $ 125.00 $ 1,625.00 $ 63.27 $ 82251 $ - $ - $ 175.00 $ 2,275.00
3,810 Cds $ 110,407.50 $ 149,489.50 $ 93,087.76 $ 117,190.00 $ 130,995.00
13.0 MBF Below Minimum
CONTINUED
SALE # 4 - BRETT FAVRE SALE - 98 ACRES - THREE YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE
Cords/ LEFLEUR SHAMCO MINERICK DELAET
MBF Minimum FOREST PRODUCTS INC. LOGGING ENTERPRISES LTD
Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
ASPEN PULP 1,290 Cds $ 27.00 $ 34,830.00 $ 23.00 $ 29,670.00 $ 33.00 $ 42,570.00 $ 42,00 $ 54,180.00 $ 3240 $ 41,796.00
OAK PULP 560 Cds $ 18.00 $ 10,080.00 $ 20.00 $ 11,200.00 $ 30.00 $ 16,800.00 $ 25,00 $ 14,000.00 $ 2840 $ 15,904.00
WHITE BIRCH PULP 345 Cds $ 2250 $ 7,762.50 $ 17.00 $ 5,865.00 $ 25.00 $ 8,625.00 $ 3500 $ 12,075.00 $ 3240 $ 11,178.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 290 Cds $ 22,50 $ 6,525.00 $ 20.00 $ 5,800.00 $ 25.00 $ 7,250.00 $ 35.00 $ 10,150.00 $ 3840 $ 11,136.00
ASPEN PULP BOLTS 1,050 Cds $ 36.00 $ 37,800.00 $ 40.00 $ 42,000.00 $ 60.00 $ 63,000.00 $ 42,00 $ 44,100.00 $ 5250 $ 55,125.00
OAK BOLTS 125 Cds $ 36.00 $ 4,500.00 $ 30.00 $ 3,750.00 $ 269.56 $ 33,695.00 $ 60.00 $ 7,500.00 $ 46.40 $ 5,800.00
WHITE BIRCH BOLTS 100 Cds $ 36.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 30.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 85.00 $ 8,500.00 $ 60.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 5440 $ 5,440.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 50 Cds $ 36.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 3500 $ 1,750.00 $ 50.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 45.00 $ 2,250.00 $ 54.40 $ 2,720.00
OAK LOGS 13 MBF $ 270.00 $ 3,510.00 $ 250.00 $ 3,250.00 $ 200.00 $ 2,600.00 $ 280.00 $ 3,640.00 $ 121.00 $ 1,573.00
3,810 Cds $ 110,407.50 $ 106,285.00 $ 185,540.00 $ 153,895.00 $ 150,672.00
13.0 MBF Error on MX bolts

No Bid Check



SALE # 5 - BIRTHDAY BALLOON SALE - 104 ACRES - THREE YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ VERSO TRIEST FOREST WILD RIVERS LEFLEUR
MBF Minimum PAPER INC PRODUCTS FORESTRY INC. FOREST PRODUCTS
Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
OAK PULP 835 Cds $ 18.00 $ 15,030.00 $ 29.70 $ 24,799.50 $ 28.00 $ 23,380.00 $ 30.80 $ 25,718.00 $ 20.00 $ 16,700.00
JACK PINE PULP 785 Cds $ 3150 $ 24,727.50 $ 36.40 $ 28,574.00 $ 33.00 $ 25905.00 $ 4360 $ 34,226.00 $ 25.00 $ 19,625.00
ASPEN PULP 400 Cds $ 27.00 $ 10,800.00 $ 26.30 $ 10,520.00 $ 35.00 $ 14,000.00 $ 28.60 $ 11,440.00 $ 21.00 $ 8,400.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 140 Cds $ 2250 $ 3,150.00 $ 17.77 $ 2,487.80 $ 27.00 $ 3,780.00 $ 36.15 $ 5061.00 $ 21.00 $  2,940.00
OAK BOLTS 200 Cds $ 36.00 $ 7,200.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 28.00 $ 5,600.00 $ 51.15 $ 10,230.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,000.00
ASPEN BOLTS 220 Cds $ 36.00 $ 7,920.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,600.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,600.00 $ 5515 $ 12,133.00 $ 35.00 $ 7,700.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 35 Cds $ 36.00 $ 1,260.00 $ 30.00 $ 1,050.00 $ 28.00 $ 980.00 $ 55.10 $ 1,92850 $ 40.00 $  1,400.00
2,615 Cds $ 70,087.50 $ 80,031.30 $ 80,245.00 $ 100,736.50 $ 62,765.00
Error on MX Pulp total
Below Minimum
CONTINUED
SALE # 5 - BIRTHDAY BALLOON SALE - 104 ACRES - THREE YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE
Cords/ MINERICK SHAMCO RANDY MCKEE DELAET
MBF Minimum LOGGING INC. TRUCKING INC. ENTERPRISES LTD
Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
OAK PULP 835 Cds $ 18.00 $ 15,030.00 $ 25.00 $ 20,875.00 $ 30.00 $ 25,050.00 $ 20.00 $ 16,700.00 $ 35.20 $ 29,392.00
JACK PINE PULP 785 Cds $ 3150 $ 24,727.50 $ 32.00 $ 25,120.00 $ 37.00 $ 29,045.00 $ 4580 $ 35953.00 $ 3820 $ 29,987.00
ASPEN PULP 400 Cds $ 27.00 $ 10,800.00 $ 30.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 33.00 $ 13,200.00 $ 30.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 23.20 $ 9,280.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 140 Cds $ 2250 $ 3,150.00 $ 3500 $ 4,900.00 $ 29.00 $ 4,060.00 $ 25.00 $ 3,500.00 $ 3220 $ 4,508.00
OAK BOLTS 200 Cds $ 36.00 $ 7,200.00 $ 60.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 109.53 $ 21,906.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 46.20 $ 9,240.00
ASPEN BOLTS 220 Cds $ 36.00 $ 7,920.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,600.00 $ 60.00 $ 13,200.00 $ 38.00 $ 8,360.00 $ 38.20 $ 8,404.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 35 Cds $ 36.00 $ 1,260.00 $ 3500 $ 1,225.00 $ 29.00 $ 1,015.00 $ 30.00 $ 1,050.00 $ 4220 $ 1,477.00
2,615 Cds $ 70,087.50 $ 82,720.00 $ 107,476.00 $ 83,563.00 $ 92,288.00

No bid Check



SALE # 6 - ONE AND DONE SALE - 19 ACRES - TWO YEAR CONTRACT - SCALE SALE

Cords/ NEWPAGE VERSO WILD RIVERS SHAMCO

MBF Minimum CORPORATION PAPER INC FORESTRY INC. INC.

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
JACK PINE PULP 320 Cds $ 31.50 $ 10,080.00 $ 33.00 $ 10,560.00 $ 36.00 $ 11,520.00 $ 4115 $ 13,168.00 $ 3529 $ 11,292.80
ASPEN PULP 25 Cds $ 27.00 $ 675.00 $ 19.00 $ 475.00 $ 25.00 $ 625.00 $ 28.60 $ 715.00 $ 30.19 $ 754.75
MIXED CONIFER PULP 45 Cds $ 2250 $ 1,01250 $ 28.00 $ 1,260.00 $ 35.00 $ 1,575.00 $ 38.15 $ 1,716.75 $ 32.00 $ 1,440.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 40 Cds $ 2250 $ 900.00 $ 27.00 $ 1,080.00 $ 25.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 3460 $ 1,384.00 $ 2568 $ 1,027.20
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 10 Cds $ 36.00 $ 360.00 $ 27.00 $ 270.00 $ 30.00 $ 300.00 $ 45.15 $ 451.50 $ -

440 Cds $ 13,027.50 $ 13,645.00 $ 15,020.00 $ 17,435.25 $ 14,514.75
No Bid on MX Bolts

CONTINUED
SALE # 6 - ONE AND DONE SALE - 19 ACRES - TWO YEAR CONTRACT - SCALE SALE

Cords/ MINERICK DELAET RANDY MCKEE

MBF Minimum LOGGING ENTERPRISES LTD TRUCKING INC.

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
JACK PINE PULP 320 Cds $ 31.50 $ 10,080.00 $ 32.00 $ 10,240.00 $ 35.60 $ 11,392.00 $ 45.00 $ 14,400.00
ASPEN PULP 25 Cds $ 27.00 $ 675.00 $ 27.00 $ 675.00 $ 23.60 $ 590.00 $ 30.00 $ 750.00
MIXED CONIFER PULP 45 Cds $ 22,50 $ 1,01250 $ 30.00 $ 1,350.00 $ 16.60 $ 747.00 $ 25.00 $ 1,125.00
MIXED HDWD PULP 40 Cds $ 2250 $ 900.00 $ 30.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 3460 $ 1,384.00 $ 25.00 $ 1,000.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 10 Cds $ 36.00 $ 360.00 $ 30.00 $ 300.00 $ 34.60 $ 346.00 $ -

440 Cds $ 13,027.50 $ 13,765.00 $ 14,459.00 $ 17,275.00

No Bid on MX Bolts



SALE # 7 - DEAD PECKER SALE - 50 ACRES - TWO YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ NEWPAGE VERSO TRIEST FOREST SHAMCO

MBF Minimum CORPORATION PAPER INC PRODUCTS INC.

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
ASPEN PULP 540 Cds $ 27.00 $ 14,580.00 $ 2150 $ 11,610.00 $ 23.00 $ 12,420.00 $ 28.00 $ 15,120.00 $ 32.10 $ 17,334.00
SPRUCE/FIR PULP 225 Cds $ 2250 $ 5,062.50 $ 38.00 $ 8,550.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,750.00 $ 30.00 $ 6,750.00 $ 34.17 $ 7,688.25
MIXED HDWD PULP 80 Cds $ 2250 $ 1,800.00 $ 26.00 $ 2,080.00 $ 25.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 25.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 26.68 $ 2,134.40
TAMARACK PULP 40 Cds $ 27.00 $ 1,080.00 $ 23.00 $ 920.00 $ 25.00 $ 1,000.00 $ 30.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 31.00 $ 1,240.00
SPRUCE/FIR BOLTS 100 Cds $ 36.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 38.00 $ 3,800.00 $ 30.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 30.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 36.17 $ 3,617.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 20 Cds $ 36.00 $ 720.00 $ 26.00 $ 520.00 $ 30.00 $ 600.00 $ 28.00 $ 560.00 $ 28.68 $ 573.60
TAMARACK BOLTS 20 Cds $ 36.00 $ 720.00 $ 23.00 $ 460.00 $ 30.00 $ 600.00 $ 30.00 $ 600.00 $ 31.00 $ 620.00

1,025 Cds $ 27,562.50 $ 27,940.00 $ 26,370.00 $  29,230.00 $ 33,207.25
Below Minimum

CONTINUED
SALE # 7 - DEAD PECKER SALE - 50 ACRES - TWO YEAR CONTRACT - LUMP SUM SALE

Cords/ MINERICK DELAET

MBF Minimum LOGGING ENTERPRISES LTD

Volume BID VALUE BID VALUE BID VALUE
ASPEN PULP 540 Cds $ 27.00 $ 14,580.00 $ 3250 $ 17,550.00 $18.70 $ 10,098.00
SPRUCE/FIR PULP 225 Cds $ 22,50 $ 5,062.50 $ 35.00 $ 7,875.00 $24.70 $ 5,557.50
MIXED HDWD PULP 80 Cds $ 2250 $ 1,800.00 $ 30.00 $  2,400.00 $28.70 $ 2,296.00
TAMARACK PULP 40 Cds $ 27.00 $ 1,080.00 $ 20.00 $ 800.00 $16.70 $ 668.00
SPRUCE/FIR BOLTS 100 Cds $ 36.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 25.00 $ 2,500.00 $24.70 $ 2,470.00
MIXED HDWD BOLTS 20 Cds $ 36.00 $ 720.00 $ 30.00 $ 600.00 $32.70 $ 654.00
TAMARACK BOLTS 20 Cds $ 36.00 $ 720.00 $ 20.00 $ 400.00 $16.70 $ 334.00

1,025 Cds $ 27,562.50 $ 32,125.00 $ 22,077.50

No Bid Check



